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Number and Name of Proposed/Revised Policy:   
 

Policy 3.5.1“Records Management” 
 
Basis and Purpose of the Proposed/Revised Policy:   
 

Code of Virginia §2.2-2648 enumerates specific areas in which the State Executive 
Council for Children’s Services (SEC) shall be responsible for the development and 
implementation of guidelines and practices for the Children’s Services Act (CSA). 
 
Specifically, §2.2-2648.D.13 of the Code of Virginia states that the SEC shall: 
“Oversee the development and implementation of uniform guidelines for 
documentation for CSA-funded services.”  
 
Section 2.2-2648.D.16 of the Code of Virginia states that the SEC shall: “Oversee 
the development and implementation of uniform data collection standards and 
the collection of data, utilizing a secure electronic client-specific database for CSA-
funded services, which shall include, but not be limited to, the following client 
specific information: (i) children served, including those placed out of state; (ii) 
individual characteristics of youths and families being served; (iii) types of services 
provided; (iv) service utilization including length of stay; (v) service expenditures; 
(vi) provider identification number for specific facilities and programs identified by 
the state in which the child receives services; (vii) a data field indicating the 
circumstances under which the child ends each service; and (viii) a data field 
indicating the circumstances under which the child exits the Children's Services 
Act program. All client-specific information shall remain confidential and only non-
identifying aggregate demographic, service, and expenditure information shall be 
made available to the public.”  
 
In addition, the Office of Children’s Services (OCS) is established pursuant to §2.2-
2649.A as the administrative entity of the SEC. 
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§2.2-5206.12 of the Code of Virginia directs local Community Policy and 
Management Teams to “Collect and provide uniform data to the Council as 
requested by the Office of Children's Services in accordance with subdivision D 16 
of §2.2-2648.” 
 
§2.2-5210 of the Code of Virginia states that: “All public agencies that have served 
a family or treated a child referred to a family assessment and planning team shall 
cooperate with this team. The agency that refers a youth and family to the team 
shall be responsible for obtaining the consent required to share agency client 
information with the team. After obtaining the proper consent, all agencies shall 
promptly deliver, upon request and without charge, such records of services, 
treatment or education of the family or child as are necessary for a full and 
informed assessment by the team. 
 
Proceedings held to consider the appropriate provision of services and funding for 
a particular child or family or both who have been referred to the family 
assessment and planning team and whose case is being assessed by this team or 
reviewed by the community policy and management team shall be confidential 
and not open to the public, unless the child and family who are the subjects of the 
proceeding request, in writing, that it be open. All information about specific 
children and families obtained by the team members in the discharge of their 
responsibilities to the team shall be confidential. 
 
Utilizing a secure electronic database, the CPMT and the family assessment and 
planning team shall provide the Office of Children's Services with client-specific 
information from the mandatory uniform assessment and information in 
accordance with subdivision D 11 of §2.2-2648.”  
 

Additionally, Executive Order 19 calls for a 25% reduction in regulatory 
requirements. By systematically examining policies, the SEC is fulfilling the 
requirements of the Executive Order and acting in the spirit of the guidance set 
forth by the Office of Regulatory Management.  
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Summary of the Proposed/Revised Policy:   
 

Policy 3.5.1 provides guidance to local CSA programs by outlining minimum 
documentation requirements to demonstrate compliance with the CSA statutory 
requirements in §2.2-2648.D.16 and §2.2-5206.12. and the management of 
printed and electronic records. 
 
Preliminary Fiscal Impact Analysis:   
 

Passage of this policy has no fiscal impact. 
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